

PYBS 2017 Uniform Bid Results

Company	Sunburst	Santo S.S.	Leon Caps	Riddell	Sharp Sports	converted	TLK Sports	converted
Item	Price	Price	Price	Price	Price	Price	Price	Price
Item 1: T-Ball Team	\$342.56	\$354.30	\$542.98	no Bid	\$24.74	\$333.34	29.87	403.26
Item 2: Rookies Team	\$342.56	\$354.30	\$542.98	no Bid	\$24.74	\$333.34	29.87	403.26
Item 3: Future Stars Team	\$453.92	\$428.04	\$542.98	no Bid	\$29.74	\$393.34	36.87	487.26
Item 4: Pinto Team	\$453.92	\$428.04	\$542.98	no Bid	\$29.74	\$393.34	36.87	487.26
Item 5: Stallion Team	\$453.92	\$428.04	\$542.98	no Bid	\$29.74	\$393.34	36.87	487.26
Item 6: Mustang Team	\$456.72	\$432.10	\$542.98	no Bid	\$29.74	\$393.34	36.87	487.26
Item 7: Bronco 5 Team	\$459.20	\$432.90	\$822.99	no Bid	\$29.74	\$393.34	36.87	487.26
Item 8: Bronco 6 Team	\$462.32	\$436.50	\$763.14	no Bid	\$29.74	\$393.34	36.87	487.26
Item 9: Division III Team	\$410.68	\$409.80	\$690.74	no Bid	\$33.74	\$449.34	32.53	441.66
Item 10: Division II Team	\$418.38	\$416.80	\$690.74	no Bid	\$33.74	\$449.34	32.53	441.66
Item 11: Division I Team	\$425.80	\$421.80	\$690.74	no Bid	\$33.74	\$449.34	32.53	441.66
Total	\$ 4,679.98	\$ 4,542.62	\$ 6,916.23		\$329.14	\$ 4,374.74	\$ 378.55	\$ 5,055.06

Add ons							
Baseball Jersey	13.18, 13.68	13.44, 14.24	17.50, 19.50	NB	10.95, 11.74		14.87, 15.41
Softball Jersey	16.68, 17.78	16.60, 17.60	22.50, 25.50	27.54, 28.83	14.95, 15.74		17.53, 18.65
Belted pants	13.18, 14.18	9.24, 10.24	14.99, 25.25	11.61, 13.09	10.95, 11.95		10.75, 11.75
T-ball Pant	\$7.98	5.23, 6.48	9.97, 12.97	5.25, 9.10	5.95, 6.95		5.75, 7.75
Caps	9.98	5.47	7.95, 8.95	NB	6.49		7
Socks	3.98	2.10	6.50	2.49	1.95		2.25
Belt	5.38	2.14	6.90	2.55	2.25		2