



Palatine Park District

Project Name: PYBS Uniform Bid

Project Number: 18-01R

Feb. 5, 2018 - 11:00 am

Staff: K. Williams

Bid Tabulation Sheet

Item:	Price:	Min. Total Base Bid		
Santo Sport Store		MIN. ORDER		
Item 1: T-Ball Team	351	351.02	7	\$ 2,457.14
Item 2: Rookies Team	351.02	351.02	10	\$ 3,510.20
Item 3: Future Stars Team	425	424.7	10	\$ 4,247.00
Item 4: Pinto Team	424.7	424.7	10	\$ 4,247.00
Item 5: Stallion Team	424.7	424.7	10	\$ 4,247.00
Item 6: Mustang Team	428.6	428.6	8	\$ 3,428.80
Item 7: Bronco 5 Team	429.38	429.38	4	\$ 1,717.52
Item 8: Bronco 6 Team	430.94	430.94	4	\$ 1,723.76
Item 9: Division III Team	360.5	360.5	7	\$ 2,523.50
Item 10: Division II Team	367.5	367.5	6	\$ 2,205.00
Item 11: Division I Team	372.5	372.5	6	\$ 2,235.00
Total	4365.56		82	\$ 32,541.92

Item:	Price:	MAX. ORDER		
Add ons		MAX. ORDER		
Baseball Jersey	5.70, 16.48	351.02	8	\$ 2,808.16
Softball Jersey	15.94, 16.94	351.02	12	\$ 4,212.24
Belted pants	8.93, 9.93	424.7	12	\$ 5,096.40
T-ball Pant	4.93, 6.38	424.7	12	\$ 5,096.40
Caps	5.59	424.7	12	\$ 5,096.40
Socks	2.1	428.6	10	\$ 4,286.00
Belt	2.14	429.38	5	\$ 2,146.90
		430.94	5	\$ 2,154.70
		360.5	9	\$ 3,244.50
		367.5	6	\$ 2,205.00
		372.5	8	\$ 2,980.00
			99	\$ 39,326.70
			10% Cc	\$ 3,932.67
			Max Bi	\$ 43,259.37

Item:	Price:
Riddel	
Item 1: T-Ball Team	no bid
Item 2: Rookies Team	no bid
Item 3: Future Stars Team	no bid
Item 4: Pinto Team	no bid
Item 5: Stallion Team	no bid
Item 6: Mustang Team	no bid
Item 7: Bronco 5 Team	no bid
Item 8: Bronco 6 Team	no bid
Item 9: Division III Team	no bid
Item 10: Division II Team	no bid
Item 11: Division I Team	no bid
Total	