



Palatine Park District  
 2019 Program Brochure Printing Bid  
 Friday, October 5, 2018  
 Bid Tabulation Sheet

**SADDLE STITCH**

Company --->	Indiana Printing & Publishing			BluEdge		
	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3
96	\$ 82,564.00	2%	2%	\$ 406,308.05	No Bid	No Bid
100	\$ 84,812.00	2%	2%	\$ 410,400.00	No Bid	No Bid
104	\$ 87,032.00	2%	2%	\$ 416,800.00	No Bid	No Bid
108	\$ 89,256.00	2%	2%	\$ 422,300.00	No Bid	No Bid
112	\$ 91,696.00	2%	2%	\$ 448,900.00	No Bid	No Bid
116	\$ 94,232.00	2%	2%	\$ 454,300.00	No Bid	No Bid
120	\$ 96,452.00	2%	2%	\$ 460,700.00	No Bid	No Bid

**PERFECT BINDING**

Company --->	Indiana Printing & Publishing			Blue Edge		
	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3
96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 400,895.85	No Bid	No Bid
100	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 404,900.00	No Bid	No Bid
104	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 412,200.00	No Bid	No Bid
108	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 418,300.00	No Bid	No Bid
112	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 444,991.52	No Bid	No Bid
116	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 452,100.00	No Bid	No Bid
120	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 458,600.00	No Bid	No Bid

Accept Procurement Cards	Yes; No Conditions
Delivery Cost	\$ 8,170.00
Correction Terms	-
Submittals	Stock; No Product Samples

Yes; Standard Terms
N/A
No Additional Charges
Stock; No Product Samples



Palatine Park District  
 2019 Program Brochure Printing Bid  
 Friday, October 5, 2018  
 Bid Tabulation Sheet

**SADDLE STITCH**

Company --->	American Litho			John Swift		
	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3
96	\$ 26,324.00	Negotiable	Negotiable	\$ 26,114.00	1.5%	2%
100	\$ 28,978.00	Negotiable	Negotiable	\$ 27,245.00	1.5%	2%
104	\$ 28,221.00	Negotiable	Negotiable	\$ 28,391.00	1.5%	2%
108	\$ 30,925.00	Negotiable	Negotiable	\$ 29,254.00	1.5%	2%
112	\$ 29,397.00	Negotiable	Negotiable	\$ 30,129.00	1.5%	2%
116	\$ 32,051.00	Negotiable	Negotiable	Perfect Binding Only	-	-
120	\$ 32,048.00	Negotiable	Negotiable	Perfect Binding Only	-	-

**PERFECT BINDING**

Company --->	American Litho			John Swift		
	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3
96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 26,664.00	1.5%	2%
100	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 27,820.00	1.5%	2%
104	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 28,991.00	1.5%	2%
108	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29,879.00	1.5%	2%
112	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 30,779.00	1.5%	2%
116	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 31,639.00	1.5%	2%
120	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 32,481.00	1.5%	2%

Accept Procurement Cards	No
Delivery Cost	Included
Correction Terms	\$50.00/hr
Submittals	Inc. Stock and Product Samples

No
-
\$15.00/pg
Inc. Stock and Product Samples



Palatine Park District  
 2019 Program Brochure Printing Bid  
 Friday, October 5, 2018  
 Bid Tabulation Sheet

**SADDLE STITCH**

Company --->	KK Stevens			Action Printing		
	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3
Page Count inc. Cover						
96	\$ 20,626.83	5%	10%	\$ 25,087.00	No Bid	No Bid
100	\$ 20,968.97	5%	10%	\$ 24,835.00	No Bid	No Bid
104	\$ 22,525.38	5%	10%	\$ 26,981.00	No Bid	No Bid
108	\$ 23,025.44	5%	10%	\$ 27,333.00	No Bid	No Bid
112	\$ 23,395.05	5%	10%	\$ 28,394.00	No Bid	No Bid
116	\$ 24,028.44	5%	10%	\$ 28,793.00	No Bid	No Bid
120	\$ 25,213.70	5%	10%	\$ 29,487.00	No Bid	No Bid

**PERFECT BINDING**

Company --->	KK Stevens			Action Printing		
	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3	Year 1	Year 2	Year 3
Page Count inc. Cover						
96	\$ 25,232.74	5%	10%	\$ 25,214.00	No Bid	No Bid
100	\$ 24,790.28	5%	10%	\$ 24,297.00	No Bid	No Bid
104	\$ 26,120.85	5%	10%	\$ 27,124.00	No Bid	No Bid
108	\$ 26,986.31	5%	10%	\$ 27,464.00	No Bid	No Bid
112	\$ 28,530.55	5%	10%	\$ 28,487.00	No Bid	No Bid
116	\$ 27,874.42	5%	10%	\$ 28,887.00	No Bid	No Bid
120	\$ 29,418.66	5%	10%	\$ 29,544.00	No Bid	No Bid

Accept Procurement Cards	Yes; 3% Processing
Delivery Cost	Included
Correction Terms	Alterations \$80/hr
Submittals	Inc. Stock and Product Samples

Yes; No Conditions
Included
\$85/hr Corrections
Inc. Stock and Product Samples