



Note: Option 1 = saddle stitch, Option 2 = perfect binding

Company		K.K. Stevens Publishing Company	Indiana Printing & Publishing Co.	Action Printing	NPC, Inc.	Blink Signs	John S. Swift Co., Inc.
68 Pages	Option 1	\$ 15,807.31	\$ 18,202.00	\$ 19,243.99			
	Option 2	\$ 18,901.48	No Bid	N/A			
	Term 2, Option 1	\$ 16,597.68	\$ 18,202.00	\$ 19,821.31			
	Term 2, Option 2	\$ 19,846.55	No Bid	N/A			
	Term 3, Option 1	\$ 17,388.04	\$ 18,202.00	\$ 20,415.95			
	Term 3, Option 2	\$ 20,791.63	No Bid	N/A			
76 Pages	Option 1	\$ 18,016.11	\$ 19,453.00	\$ 21,387.06			
	Option 2	\$ 20,840.40	No Bid	N/A			
	Term 2, Option 1	\$ 18,916.91	\$ 19,453.00	\$ 22,028.67			
	Term 2, Option 2	\$ 21,882.42	No Bid	N/A			
	Term 3, Option 1	\$ 19,817.72	\$ 19,453.00	\$ 22,689.53			
	Term 3, Option 2	\$ 22,924.44	No Bid	N/A			
84 Pages	Option 1	\$ 19,178.48	\$ 20,612.00	\$ 22,028.23			
	Option 2	\$ 22,864.29	No Bid	\$ 23,355.23			
	Term 2, Option 1	\$ 20,137.40	\$ 20,612.00	\$ 22,689.08			
	Term 2, Option 2	\$ 24,007.50	No Bid	\$ 24,055.89			
	Term 3, Option 1	\$ 21,096.33	\$ 20,612.00	\$ 23,369.75			
	Term 3, Option 2	\$ 25,150.72	No Bid	\$ 24,777.56			
92 Pages	Option 1	\$ 20,727.23	\$ 21,857.00	\$ 23,560.87			
	Option 2	\$ 24,271.75	No Bid	\$ 24,887.87			
	Term 2, Option 1	\$ 21,763.60	\$ 21,857.00	\$ 24,267.70			
	Term 2, Option 2	\$ 25,485.33	No Bid	\$ 25,634.51			
	Term 3, Option 1	\$ 22,799.96	\$ 21,857.00	\$ 24,995.73			
	Term 3, Option 2	\$ 26,698.92	No Bid	\$ 26,403.54			
100 Pages	Option 1	\$ 21,550.11	\$ 23,016.00	\$ 24,184.92			
	Option 2	\$ 25,231.06	No Bid	\$ 25,511.92			
	Term 2, Option 1	\$ 22,670.61	\$ 23,016.00	\$ 23,369.75			
	Term 2, Option 2	\$ 26,473.72	No Bid	\$ 26,277.28			
	Term 3, Option 1	\$ 23,705.12	\$ 23,016.00	\$ 24,070.84			
	Term 3, Option 2	\$ 27,734.37	No Bid	\$ 27,065.60			
108 Pages	Option 1	\$ 23,864.61	N/A	\$ 26,543.80			
	Option 2	\$ 27,151.94	No Bid	\$ 27,870.80			
	Term 2, Option 1	\$ 25,057.84	N/A	\$ 27,340.11			
	Term 2, Option 2	\$ 28,509.54	No Bid	\$ 28,706.92			
	Term 3, Option 1	\$ 26,251.07	N/A	\$ 28,160.32			
	Term 3, Option 2	\$ 29,867.13	No Bid	\$ 29,568.13			
116 Pages	Option 1	\$ 24,511.00	N/A	\$ 27,206.91			
	Option 2	\$ 28,230.75	No Bid	\$ 28,533.91			
	Term 2, Option 1	\$ 25,736.55	N/A	\$ 28,023.12			
	Term 2, Option 2	\$ 29,642.29	No Bid	\$ 29,389.93			
	Term 3, Option 1	\$ 26,962.10	N/A	\$ 28,863.81			
	Term 3, Option 2	\$ 31,053.83	No Bid	\$ 30,271.63			
Delivery	Included	Included	Included				
Accept P-Card	Yes, 3% Processing	Yes, 2.5% Processing	Yes				
Correction Fees	\$80.00 per hour	None	None				

NO BID